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Status is a form of social standing distinct from 
class. Although both involve perceptions, class 
is derived from an individual’s (perceived) rela-
tionship to the market, yet status has a uniquely 
intersubjective quality. Weber defines status as 
“an effective claim to social esteem in terms of 
positive or negative privileges” (1968, 305). 
Thus, status—unlike other dimensions of so-
cial inequality, such as class or power—is fun-
damentally rooted in shared cultural percep-
tions of who deserves honor, respect, and 
esteem (Ridgeway 2019; Lamont 2012).

Yet the extent to which perceptions of status 
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are widely shared remains an open question. 
How do we understand where someone falls in 
the status order? To what extent is our view 
similar to—or different from—others’ views of 
the social hierarchy? This study examines the 
cognitive processes underlying the way people 
in the United States make judgments of social 
status. I focus on Americans’ mental maps of 
the occupational status hierarchy, using a cul-
tural cognitive approach at the intersection of 
the sociology of culture and social psychology. 
In so doing, this study develops a new concept 
around perceptions of status—status lenses. 
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1. Status can be measured in various ways, certainly, such as consumption patterns and tastes (Bourdieu 1984), 
symbolic boundaries (Lamont 1992, 2000), third-party rankings (Sauder 2006), subjective social status (Nielsen, 
Roos, and Combs 2015), and sociometric status (Jiang and Cillessen 2005). Expectation states theory in socio-
logical social psychology argues that identities such as sex, race, education level, or even right- versus left-
handedness can acquire a particular status (in the language of expectation states, they become diffuse status 
characteristics), leading to performance expectations (Berger et al. 1977; see also Ridgeway 2014).

This concept captures two dimensions related 
to perceptions of status: how flat or hierarchi-
cal the status order is seen as (sensitivity or dis-
crimination) and how much a given group 
agrees or disagrees about the status order (con-
sensus and dissensus). Further, I examine the 
extent to which different social groups use dif-
ferent status lenses. In particular, I consider 
the hypothesis that individuals closer to the 
traditional centers of power in American soci-
ety (Whites, men, more educated, higher earn-
ing) have a status lens distinct from that of 
those who have been historically excluded from 
core American institutions (ethno-racial mi-
norities, women, less educated, lower earning).

To test this hypothesis, I use data on judg-
ments of occupational prestige, which is his-
torically one of the most common measures of 
status sociologists use.1 Occupational prestige 
reflects the way we value the division of labor 
within a society by expressing whose role is 
most important, worthy, and deserving of so-
cial acclaim. It captures not just how much tal-
ent, hard work, or experience is required to per-
form that role or how much a person should be 
materially rewarded for fulfilling it—occupa-
tional prestige also reflects a moral (MacKin-
non and Langford 1994) and deferential (Free-
land and Hoey 2018; Maloney 2020; see 
Maloney, Rogers, and Smith-Lovin 2022, this 
issue) component of that role, in addition to 
inscribing elements of existing gender and ra-
cial inequalities (Valentino 2020, 2022). Thus 
occupational prestige is an ideal test case for 
examining perceptions of status, whether cer-
tain social groups vary in terms of how sensi-
tive or discriminating they are in perceiving the 
status order, and whether there is more or less 
consensus within those groups.

Sharedness in Status Percep tions
Much research on status—particularly in the 
area of occupational prestige—assumes a rela-
tively high degree of uniformity in how people 

perceive the status hierarchy. Early social theo-
rists argued that society itself is defined by its 
singular, homogeneous view of the status order. 
Émile Durkheim’s (1912) notion of the con-
science collective captures the idea of a set of 
fundamental representations or symbols 
shared among all members of a society. For 
Durkheim, these shared representations or 
symbols encode social categories and classifi-
cation systems. In the transition from a “prim-
itive” society (characterized by mechanical sol-
idarity) to a “modern” one (characterized by 
organic solidarity), the division of labor comes 
to prescribe a set of fixed roles that enable so-
cial cohesion. Durkheim argues that social 
meanings are widely shared precisely because 
everyone understands where they fit into soci-
ety’s hierarchy. Talcott Parsons also views soci-
eties as having a relatively unified set of agreed-
upon values. This purported value consensus 
leads to several core features that, in Parsons’s 
view, characterize a social system: a system for 
categorizing people, places, and things; role 
definitions; a system for allocating people to 
those roles; and, most important, a system for 
allocating “sanctions and rewards, especially 
prestige and status” based on the performance 
of these roles (Parsons and Shils 1951, 257). For 
Parsons, much like Durkheim, a society is in 
fact defined by its members’ adherence to a sin-
gular view of status.

Specific to occupational prestige, studies 
throughout the twentieth century have docu-
mented high correlations between the mean 
values of a given occupation’s prestige rating 
among members of different education and in-
come levels, occupations, genders, ages, re-
gions, and even countries and time periods (for 
a review, see Wegener 1992). In his study of 
more than sixty societies, Donald Treiman 
(1977) famously asserts that “there is extraordi-
nary consensus throughout each society re-
garding the relative prestige of occupations” 
(59), indicative of what he calls a “single world-
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wide prestige hierarchy” (159). In fact, the uni-
versal agreement regarding which occupations 
are high prestige and which are low prestige is 
known among sociologists as the Treiman con-
stant. Even in more contemporary studies of 
occupational prestige, perceptions of an occu-
pation’s status are often assumed to be equiva-
lent across individuals, regardless of back-
ground.

Yet recent evidence from work on percep-
tions regarding other types of status suggest 
that a universal view of status may not always—
or even often—be the case. Women and men 
use different bases on which to determine their 
subjective class identification (Luo and Bray-
field 1996), and individuals of different social 
class backgrounds use different bases for deter-
mining social worth of other groups in the 
United States and France (Lamont 1992, 2000; 
Gorman 2000), as well as in China (Wang 2017). 
Race and ethnicity have been shown to be par-
ticularly important determinants of how a per-
son views a particular group’s status (Kahn et 
al. 2009; Wolff et al. 2010; Melamed et al. 2019). 
Kevin Leicht (2022) argues that different in-
equality regimes entail different perceptions of 
status due to an individual’s social distance 
from their near-status peers.

Even in terms of occupational prestige, 
there is reason to doubt its universality. Xue-
guang Zhou (2005) finds that a person’s educa-
tion, race, and gender are important determi-
nants of the bases upon which they confer 
prestige to a given job. Gordon Gauchat and 
Kenneth Andrews (2018) find that a person’s in-
come and degree of scientific literacy deter-
mine the extent to which Americans emphasize 
scientific prestige when understanding expert 
professions. Using inductive techniques, Lau-
ren Valentino (2021) finds evidence for five dis-
tinct logics of occupational prestige in the 
United States, and which logic a person uses  
to order the hierarchy depends on their race, 
gender, education, income, age, religiosity, and 
geographic region. In Sweden, Dustin Avent-
Holt, Martin Hällsten, and David Cort (2020) 
uncover substantial variation across organiza-
tions in terms of how occupations’ statuses are 
perceived within the workplace.

Yet most of these studies emphasize differ-
ences in mean status beliefs, saying little about 

dispersion or disagreement between and 
within groups in terms of how prestige is per-
ceived. Freda Lynn and George Ellerbach (2017) 
are an important exception: they find that 
highly educated individuals are more consis-
tent in their views on occupational status, par-
ticularly when it comes to occupations requir-
ing more educational credentials. They posit 
that education is a socializing institution that 
creates more uniformity in how people see the 
occupational structure. Using interview data, 
Amy Binder, Daniel Davis, and Nick Bloom 
(2016) find evidence for this process: they ob-
serve that elite colleges expressly narrow stu-
dents’ ideas about what constitutes a presti-
gious job. Indeed, Fabien Accominotti, Freda 
Lynn, and Michael Sauder (2022) demonstrate 
that status hierarchies vary in their architec-
tural features, depending on the context. Thus 
it is reasonable to expect that people perceive 
these architectural features differently as well 
depending on their position in society.

Status Lenses
A cultural cognitive approach lies at the inter-
section of the sociology of culture and social 
psychology, imploring scholars to focus on 
“processes or mechanisms, cognitive and so-
cial, through which cultural elements are ac-
quired, rendered salient, linked to broader pat-
terns of meaning, and displaced” (DiMaggio 
and Markus 2010, 348). The cultural cognitive 
approach thus invites social scientists to con-
sider the sharedness of status beliefs as an em-
pirical question rather than an orienting as-
sumption. Based on the emerging research 
regarding the way social structural factors 
(such as class, race, and gender) shape status 
judgments as well as the nascent evidence re-
garding key variations in how status is per-
ceived, I use the cultural cognitive approach to 
propose the existence of a more general con-
cept: status lenses.

Status lenses reflect two aspects of how sta-
tus beliefs can vary within a society: their level 
of sensitivity or discrimination, and their level 
of agreement. These dimensions are illustrated 
in figure 1. First, drawing on signal detection 
theory (Gambetta 2009; Wickens 2002), I argue 
that social groups may vary in how sensitive or 
discriminating they are—that is, how hierarchi-
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cal they perceive the status order. Some may 
have a more discriminating mental map of sta-
tus that includes a large social distance be-
tween the bottom and top positions. Other in-
dividuals, by contrast, may have a more diffuse 
one in which the positions are less differenti-
ated or distanced from one another. In social 
theory, this is known as a rhizomatic system 
(Deleuze and Guattari 1987), and in informa-
tion science and complex systems as a heterar-
chy (McCulloch 1945).

Second, social groups may vary in terms of 
the degree to which they exhibit consensus or 
dissensus about the status hierarchy. A group 
may uniformly agree about its hierarchy: it may 
order its positions identically or very similarly. 
High consensus about status is often the result 
of commensuration, the process by which qual-
itative entities become publicly defined or 
ranked by a single set of metrics (Espeland and 
Stevens 1998). Conversely, a social group may 
exhibit very little agreement about which posi-
tions fall where in the hierarchy. This phenom-
enon is known as status disagreement (Kilduff, 
Willer, and Anderson 2016) and may occur as a 
result of internal heterogeneity within groups 
(Boltanski and Thévenot 1983).

Figure 1 illustrates how these two axes work 
together to produce different types of status 
lenses. The first cell, diffuse dissensus, reflects 
a status lens in which a group perceives a rela-
tively flat hierarchy, and their mental map of 
the status order varies, reflecting a heteroge-
neous set of views. An example of the diffuse 
dissensus status lens occurs when sportscast-
ers speculate about the performance of various 
teams in a professional sports league at the be-
ginning of the season. In most leagues, the dif-
ference between the team with the best record 
and the team with the worst is still relatively 
small—both are composed of professional ath-
letes with very high levels of talent and ability. 
Furthermore, at the beginning of the season, 
fans and experts debate vigorously about who 
will have a winning record and who will not this 
season—disagreement about which teams are 
best and which are the worst is considerable. 
The next cell, diffuse consensus, reflects a reality 
in which the group agrees, relatively speaking, 
about the nature of the hierarchy, but that hi-
erarchy is much flatter. Consider small tribes 

of hunter-gatherers, which are known to be rel-
atively egalitarian but still exhibit a minimal 
division of labor (see Sterelny 2021), or certain 
nonprofit organizations (see Benjamin 2022, 
this issue).

The third cell, discriminating dissensus, would 
mean the status order takes the shape of a mul-
timodal distribution: this status lens reflects a 
situation in which a group has subgroups with 
distinctly different understandings of the status 
hierarchy, a state Pierre Bourdieu refers to as 
“classification struggles” (1984, 483). University 
rankings are emblematic of this view: although 
most people likely agree that the distance be-
tween the very worst and very best universities 
are quite large, disagreement is significant in 
terms of how the universities should be ranked. 
Indeed, we have seen a proliferation of different 
types of rankings (for example, U.S. News and 
World Report, QS World and University Rankings, 
Niche, and so on) that reflect this dissensus (see 
also Espeland and Sauder 2016). Finally, discrim-
inating consensus represents the dominant view 
in the existing literature on occupational pres-
tige and status beliefs more generally. This sta-
tus lens captures the idea of a uniform prestige 
hierarchy about which all members of a given 
group make fine-grained distinctions. Modern 
bureaucratic organizations such as the military 
or hospitals are excellent examples: everyone 
agrees on highly prescribed and differentiated 
roles, and the status distance between a private 
and a four-star general or between an orderly 
and an attending physician is large (see Jenkins 
2020).

Critically, status lenses may be socially pat-
terned, reflecting what Kimberly Rogers (2019) 
calls “cultural variegation”—the existence of 
distinctions across social groups in terms of 
cultural meanings, including (but not limited 
to) status beliefs. Earlier research leads to sev-
eral predictions. Norman Alexander (1972, 767) 
argues that “the lower the perceiver’s actual, 
imagined, or aspired-to status, the smaller the 
dispersion of his status judgments.” The mech-
anism here is in essence self-enhancement 
bias: individuals on a lower rung of the status 
ladder are motivated to move the rungs closer 
together to minimize the distance between 
their status and the highest status on the lad-
der. Alexander finds evidence for this process 
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in terms of occupational prestige as well as 
high school popularity in observing that raters 
who are lower in occupational prestige and stu-
dents who are less popular exhibited smaller 
dispersion in their ratings of others’ prestige 
and popularity. This prediction implies that 
these groups will therefore have less sensitive 
or discriminating status lenses but says little 
about consensus differences between groups.

In terms of consensus, the institutional log-
ics perspective suggests that socializing institu-
tions such as schools, workplaces, and neigh-
borhoods will lead to converging views of what 
constitutes high status versus low status within 
certain groups (see Zhou 2005). Here two mech-
anisms are relevant. First, consistent views of 
status enable coordination within organiza-
tions. Thus organizations such as workplaces 
have a vested interest in imposing explicit sta-
tus hierarchies as a way of facilitating efficiency 
and productivity. They may also emerge induc-
tively and become entrenched through path de-
pendency as individuals solve coordination 
problems on the ground—for instance, when 
deciding who should take notes at an office 
meeting, or nominating someone to run for 
president of a school’s parent-teacher associa-
tion. Second, once individuals have been so-
cialized within these formal institutions—es-
pecially schools and universities—they become 
invested in justifying the allocation of rewards 
(such as status) on the basis of these institu-
tions’ credentials. Those who are the most 
likely to reap rewards from these credentials—
Whites, men, the higher earning in the United 

States—are the most likely to see these creden-
tials as fair bases for resource distribution (see 
Cech and Blair-Loy 2010). This prediction im-
plies that these groups have more consensus in 
terms of their status lens but says little about 
whether they are more or less sensitive or dis-
criminating. It is therefore vital to consider the 
two dimensions of status lenses simultane-
ously.

This study thus seeks to first answer the 
question of whether status lenses exist. It then 
determines the degree to which different social 
groups have different status lenses—that is, 
whether they exhibit varying levels of sensitiv-
ity or discrimination about the status hierarchy 
and agreement (consensus versus dissensus) 
about the rank order of that hierarchy. I focus 
on two key sets of groups in American society: 
those who are closer to the traditional centers 
of power (men, Whites, the college educated, 
and higher earners), and those who are farther 
away (women, racial minorities, those without 
a college degree, and lower earners). Using the 
case study of occupational prestige judgments, 
I bring a cultural cognitive approach to bear on 
what has largely been an orienting assumption 
for much of the existing research on status.

Data and Methods
The source of data for this study is the 2012 oc-
cupational prestige module from the General 
Social Survey (GSS). Every few decades, to up-
date its prestige score variable, the National 
Opinion Research Center, which administers 
the GSS, asks a subset of its survey-takers to 

Figure 1. Conceptual Representation of Four Status Lenses

Source: Author’s conceptual diagram.
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2. This list also includes a handful of unusual or unofficial occupations, such as street corner drug dealer and 
panhandler.

rate a number of occupational titles spanning 
the breadth of occupations in the United 
States.2 In 2012, members of the in-person ro-
tating panel were asked to complete the occu-
pational prestige module, a total of 1,001 re-
spondents. The module uses a split-ballot 
design, in which 860 total occupational titles 
are rated, but each survey respondent is ran-
domly assigned to one of twelve possible bal-
lots including seventy occupations. Every re-
spondent is also asked to rate twenty core 
occupations. Respondents are presented with 
a stack of cards with the ninety occupational 
titles and a box with slots labeled one through 
nine. They are instructed to place each occupa-
tion in the slot corresponding to its social 
standing, one being the lowest and nine being 
the highest (for data collection details, see 
Smith and Son 2014). Although most research-
ers use the scaled occupational prestige scores 
that are trimmed and aggregated measures of 
occupational status, I obtained the raw ratings 
data from NORC in order to examine the micro-
level, cognitive process by which these status 
judgments are made.

The GSS is a national probability sample of 

Americans, and thus the subset of those who 
participated in the occupational prestige mod-
ule are largely representative of the United 
States in 2012 (see table 1). The analytic sample 
includes 1,001 respondents and detail about 
their gender, race-ethnicity, educational attain-
ment, income, and age. Demographic data and 
work-related variables (work status and pres-
tige score of own job) are also included in some 
models as well.

Beginning with occupations, we can see that 
the mean occupational rating is 5.7 of 9. As we 
can see in panel A of figure 2, however, some 
occupations were rated very low on average 
(street corner drug dealer received a mean rat-
ing of 1.902) and some were rated very high on 
average (surgeon received a mean rating of 
7.744), indicating an occupational hierarchy. 
Further, respondents varied dramatically in 
how dispersed their ratings were, as evidenced 
by the histogram in panel B. Some respondents 
exhibited high dispersion, with variances as 
large as 12.053; others exhibited low dispersion, 
as low as 0.198. I use this within-respondent 
dispersion as a measure of sensitivity and dis-
crimination.

Table 1. Descriptive Statistics of GSS Sample

Proportion

Male .449
Female .551
White .792
Black .142
Hispanic .026
Asian .026
Other race .008
Work less than full time .527
Working full time .474

Mean SD

Prestige rating 4.538 .928
Education (years) 13.661 2.911
Income 58173.30 42549.74
Age 51.633 16.326
Prestige score of own job 43.991 13.185

Source: Author’s calculations.
Note: Descriptives shown for full sample (N = 1,001).
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To assess whether this dimension of status 
lenses varies across social groups, I examine 
person-specific variance in occupational pres-
tige ratings. Because different people rated dif-
ferent occupations, looking at the overall dis-
persion of respondents’ occupational prestige 

ratings is the best way to ascertain sensitivity 
and discrimination. Higher levels of individual 
dispersion indicate that a rater perceives a 
large status distance between the lowest-
prestige and highest-prestige occupations, 
whereas lower levels of individual dispersion 

Figure 2. Occupational Means and Rater Variances in Prestige

Source: Author’s calculations.
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3. The median household income in 2012 was $51,371 (Noss 2013). Because the GSS asks respondents to pro-
vide their household income in categories, I consider a respondent “at or above median income” if they selected 
an income category of $50,000 or more. Calculations in regression models use logged midpoint values of the 
income category to account for right-skewness in the distribution.

indicate that a rater perceives a small status 
distance between the lowest-prestige and 
highest-prestige occupations. I begin by look-
ing at descriptive differences between groups 
in terms of variance in their ratings to assess 
whether they may be more or less sensitive or 
discriminating in how they perceive the hierar-
chy. Next, I model person-level variance in pres-
tige ratings as a function of these group vari-
ables to isolate the specific relationship 
between each demographic characteristic and 
the variation in prestige ratings. I use Poisson 
regression with variance as the outcome be-
cause this variable is noticeably right-skewed 
(see figure 2, panel B) and follows a Poisson 
distribution (its mean and variance are nearly 
identical); furthermore, this modeling ap-
proach avoids the problem of producing nega-
tive predictions, which are nonsensical in the 
case of variances. All models include robust 
standard errors to account for potential viola-
tion of the dispersion assumption (see Cam-
eron and Trivedi 2013). I also include ballot con-
trols in all models to account for possible 
anchoring effects in terms of how respondents 
rated the particular list of occupations they re-
ceived.

To examine agreement (level of consensus 
versus dissensus) within groups, I focus on how 
respondents ranked the twenty core occupa-
tions because these were the only ones that all 
members of the sample rated. I convert each 
respondents’ ratings into rankings to account 
for potential differences in the sensitivity-
discrimination component of status percep-
tions. Rankings focus on the order of occupa-
tions without regard for the distance between 
them, and disregarding distance is necessary 
to isolate the consensus dimension of status 
lenses. I next compute all pairwise dyads of re-
spondents (N = 500,500) in these rank order-
ings, which allows me to examine the extent to 
which every possible combination of raters 
agree with one another in terms of how these 
occupations should be ordered. I use Spear-
man’s rho, as well as Kendall’s tau, to calculate 

these pairwise correlations. To assess whether 
groups agree or disagree about these orderings, 
I focus on whether pairs of matched dyads from 
the far group (for example, women) are more 
or less likely to exhibit a higher ordinal correla-
tion relative to matched dyads of the close 
group (for example, men). I first examine de-
scriptive differences in these correlations, and 
then regress the group-level variables on these 
correlations to examine their unique contribu-
tions to level of consensus.

Findings
I begin by examining descriptive differences in 
sensitivity-discrimination between groups. To 
simplify comparisons in figure 3, I dichotomize 
education into those who do not have a college 
degree versus those who have a college degree 
(or higher credential) and income into below 
median income versus at or above median in-
come.3 I consider those who identify as White 
versus non-White and those who identify as 
male versus female.

This figure reveals key differences between 
groups with regard to how discriminating they 
are in their prestige ratings. In terms of gender, 
we see that women exhibit more dispersion 
than men. This is borne out in the median-
centered Levene’s test of equality of variances 
(F = 181.329, p < .001). In terms of race, respon-
dents who are racial minorities exhibit more 
dispersion than White respondents, also con-
firmed by the median-centered Levene’s test 
(F = 347.318, p < .001). Looking at education, re-
spondents who do not have a college degree 
exhibit more dispersion than those who do 
have a college degree, evidenced by the signifi-
cant median-centered Levene’s test (F = 645.447, 
p < .001). Finally, respondents whose house-
hold income is below the median exhibit more 
dispersion than those whose income is at or 
above the median level, again supported by the 
median-centered Levene’s test (F = 568.566, 
p < .001).

Yet we know that many of these variables are 
interrelated; thus it is important to disentangle 
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4. Additional analyses testing for a quadratic effect of age did not change the nonsignificance of the variable 
and did not improve model fit. Tables A.1 and A.2 test alternative specifications of dispersion using a log-linear 
and generalized binomial approach, respectively. Both alternative models demonstrate patterns consistent with 
the Poisson results presented in table 2.

the unique impact of each social structural fac-
tor on the sensitivity of prestige ratings. I there-
fore turn now to the Poisson regression mod-
els, which simultaneously estimate the impact 
of gender, race, education, and income, with 
controls for age and ballot. Model 1 estimates 
these group-level variables. Model 2 introduces 
the work-related variables to capture whether 
a respondent is working full time, part time, or 
not at all, and the prestige score of a respon-
dent’s own job. As seen in table 2, both models 
exhibit nonsignificant goodness-of-fit statistics 
( p > .05) for the deviance and Pearson tests, 
suggesting that the Poisson specification fits 
the data well in both cases.

Results from model 1 demonstrate that 
women have a larger variance than men, net of 
race-ethnicity, education, income, and age, by 
about 16 percent. Black respondents have 
around 20 percent larger variance than White 
respondents, all else equal, although Hispanic 
and Asian respondents do not significantly dif-
fer from White respondents. The more educa-
tion and income a respondent has, the smaller 

their variance, net of other variables. For every 
additional year of education, the ratings vari-
ance decreases by about 2.7 percent; for every 
$10,000 of additional household income, they 
decrease by about 3 percent. Finally, a respon-
dent’s age does not have an independent effect 
on the dispersion of their ratings.4 Introducing 
work-related variables in model 2 very slightly 
attenuates the gender, race, education, and in-
come variables, but differences between social 
structural groups remain significant nonethe-
less. A person’s work status as well as the aver-
age prestige score of their own occupation do 
not seem to impact the degree of sensitivity or 
discrimination with which they view prestige. 
Overall, then, these results demonstrate that 
women, Black respondents, less-educated and 
lower-income respondents are more likely to 
have a dispersed view of the occupational hier-
archy—evidence that those furthest from the 
traditional centers of power in American soci-
ety have higher levels of sensitivity and dis-
crimination in their status views.

The results for sensitivity-discrimination 

Table 2. Poisson Regression of Ratings Variance on Group Level Variables

Model 1 Model 2

Female .144*** (.032) .138*** (.032)
Blacka .186*** (.044) .187*** (.045)
Hispanica –.078 (.113) –.066 (.119)
Asiana –.080 (.080) –.075 (.082)
Other racea .197 (.167) .181 (.166)
Education (years) –.027*** (.006) –.023** (.008)
Income (logged) –.034** (.012) –.039** (.011)
Age –.001 (.001) –.002 (.001)
Working full time –.046 (.035)
Prestige score of own job –.001 (.001)
Constant 2.051*** (.144) 2.083*** (.144)
Ballot controls? Yes Yes
Deviance goodness-of-fit 785.282 758.642
Pearson goodness-of-fit 779.289 754.772
N 927 903

Source: Author’s calculations.
a Reference group is Whites.
* p < .05; ** p < .01; *** p < .001 (two-tailed tests)
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5. Figures A.1 and A.2 chart these relationships using Kendall’s tau. The overall pattern remains the same to the 
results using Spearman’s rho shown here.

are illustrated in figure 4 using predicted values 
of key independent variables, holding all other 
variables at their means and modes. These fig-
ures help demonstrate the magnitude of each 
social structural variable net of other factors. 
All else constant, men’s dispersion is smaller 
than women’s by 0.552, and White respon-
dents’ dispersion smaller than that of Black re-
spondents by 0.765. In terms of education, go-
ing from a high school diploma to a college 
degree decreases a respondent’s prestige dis-
persion by 0.408. Going from the 25th percen-
tile of household income to the 75th percentile 
of median income diminishes a respondent’s 
dispersion by 0.178. We can conclude that race 
(specifically, White versus Black) is the most 
important determinant of how sensitive or dis-
criminating a respondent is in their percep-
tions of the status hierarchy, followed by gen-
der, followed by education, followed by income.

I now turn to the question of agreement. We 
have seen that women, racial minorities, less-
educated, and lower-earning respondents per-
ceive a more hierarchical status order in terms 
of occupational prestige. But can we claim that 
these groups necessarily perceive a more highly 

differentiated occupational status hierarchy—
a discriminating consensus status lens? Or do 
they simply exhibit more heterogeneity overall 
in their views of the status order—a discrimi-
nating dissensus status lens? To investigate 
this second dimension of status lenses, I now 
turn to the pairwise rankings data. Spearman 
correlations for the rankings of close dyads 
(men, Whites, more educated, higher earning) 
versus far dyads (women, racial minorities, less 
educated, lower earning) are shown in figure 5.5

Descriptively, we can see that groups further 
from the traditional centers of power have 
lower dyadic correlations, suggesting a relative 
lack of agreement (dissensus) within these 
groups in terms of how they perceive the status 
order. T-tests between group dyads reveal that 
men are significantly more likely to agree than 
women (t = 6.726, p < .001), Whites are signifi-
cantly more likely to agree than racial minori-
ties (t = 11.370, p < .001), those with a college 
degree are significantly more likely to agree 
than those without (t = 17.568, p < .001), and 
those at or above the median income are sig-
nificantly more likely to agree than those below 
it (t = 15.106, p < .001). However, it is once again 

Figure 4. Predicted Dispersion for Groups Close to and Far from Centers of Power

Source: Author’s calculations.
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6. Figures A.3 and A.4 illustrate these relationships with Kendall’s tau, once again demonstrating a similar pat-
tern in terms of differences and effect sizes.

important to parse out unique effects of each 
social structural variable because we know 
these four factors are deeply interrelated. I 
therefore regress these four structural variables 
onto the correlations using linear regression 
with robust standard errors clustered by re-
spondent to account for the dyadic structure of 
the data. These results are presented in table 3.

Results indicate that women are not statisti-
cally significantly different from men in terms 
of their level of agreement once controls are 
included in the models. However, Whites ex-
hibit significantly higher levels of consensus, 
as do those with a college degree, and those at 
or above the median household income relative 
to non-Whites, those without a college degree, 
and those below the median income, respec-
tively. These differences are illustrated using 
predicted values in figure 6. As we can see, race 
once again has the largest impact on consen-
sus, with a difference of 0.037 between Whites 
and non-Whites in terms of their Spearman 
correlations. Education is next in importance, 
with a difference of 0.036 between those with a 
college degree and those without. Finally, in-
come is third in importance, showing a differ-
ence of 0.011 between those at or above the me-
dian income and those below it.6

Results from the second part of the analysis 
provide evidence that gender does not shape 
level of agreement—both men and women are 
similar in their degree of consensus regarding 
the status order—but race, education, and in-
come do shape level of agreement—respon-

dents who are racial minorities, have less edu-
cation, and have lower income all have 
significantly lower levels of consensus. Overall, 
then, we can conclude that gender affects sen-
sitivity and discrimination but not consensus, 
whereas race, education, and income affect 
both dimensions.

Discussion and Conclusion
Using perceptions of occupational prestige as 
a measure of status beliefs, this study finds ev-
idence for three different types of status lenses 
among social groups in the United States. 
Women have a discriminating consensus status 
lens: they perceive a highly differentiated oc-
cupational hierarchy and tend to agree about 
how the positions should be ranked. Men, 
Whites, highly educated respondents, and 
high-earning respondents have a diffuse con-
sensus status lens: they tend to perceive a rela-
tively flat occupational status hierarchy and 
they agree about the order of the occupations 
within that hierarchy. Black, less-educated, and 
lower-earning respondents have a discriminat-
ing dissensus status lens: they perceive consid-
erable distance between the high and low posi-
tions within the hierarchy, and they exhibit 
heterogeneity in terms of where they think 
those positions should rank within that hierar-
chy, consistent with Andrei Boutyline and Ste-
phen Vaisey’s (2017) findings regarding how 
lower educated individuals exhibit less orga-
nized political attitudes and David Harding’s 
(2007) findings regarding the presence of cul-

Table 3. Linear Regression of Ranked Correlations on Group Level Variables

Spearman’s ρ Kendall’s τ A Kendall’s τ B

Male .010 (.007) .005 (.004) .010 (.006)
White .037*** (.008) .022*** (.005) .032*** (.007)
College .036*** (.009) .024*** (.005) .031*** (.008)
At or above median income .017* (.008) .010* (.005) .015* (.007)
Constant .050*** (.007) .031*** (.004) .043*** (.006)
N dyads 49,234 48,692 48,692

Source: Author’s calculations.
Standard errors clustered by respondent ID. Reference category is “far” group (female, non-Whites, no 
college degree, below median income).
* p < .05; ** p < .01; *** p < .001 (two-tailed tests)
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tural heterogeneity in disadvantaged neighbor-
hoods. Altogether, these results indicate that 
analysts should no longer conclude that every-
one uses a widely agreed-upon, highly sensi-
tive, and discriminating status lens to make 
sense of the occupational hierarchy. As I show, 
this is only true for one group—women—in the 
United States.

Instead, consistent with the nascent evi-
dence on how social structure shapes a per-
son’s status beliefs, I find that gender, race-
ethnicity, and social class play an important 
role in which status lens a person uses. What 
is driving these differences in status lenses? 
Findings align with the idea that groups that 
are farther away from the traditional centers of 
power in the United States—women, racial mi-
norities, the less educated, and lower-earning 
individuals—are more likely to experience sta-
tus threats during interactions and to have to 
navigate situations in which status is visible 
and highly salient to them (see Ridgeway and 
Markus 2022, this issue). This helps explain why 
they perceive larger social distance between 
low-status and high-status roles and positions. 
The results regarding group differences in con-
sensus and dissensus can likely be explained 
by the institutional logics perspective: social-
izing institutions and on-the-ground coordina-

tion problems have likely led to greater levels 
of agreement regarding the status hierarchy 
among Whites, the college educated, and 
higher-earning individuals as a result of time 
spent in schools, universities, workplaces, 
associations, and other formal organizations. 
Racial minorities, the less educated, and lower-
earning individuals have likely had less forma-
tive experience in these socializing institutions 
and therefore are less likely to hold unified 
views of the status order. Nevertheless, future 
studies should directly examine the degree to 
which status threat and socializing institutions 
can explain these differences in perceptions of 
status. Furthermore, the present analytic ap-
proach is limited in its ability to draw conclu-
sions about the intersectional impact of these 
social groups on status lenses. Overcoming this 
limitation using intersectional techniques is 
another important avenue for future research.

The extent to which these particular status 
lenses are used in realms other than occupa-
tional status remains an open question. In par-
ticular, I suspect that other-regarding status 
beliefs, such as sociometric status, may follow 
the pattern observed here, whereas status be-
liefs that are self-regarding (for example, sub-
jective social standing and class identification) 
may not, given their complex relationships to 

Figure 6. Predicted Correlations of Dyads in Rank Orderings of Core Occupations by Social Group

Source: Author’s calculations.
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identity and self-perception. Further, the cur-
rent findings raise questions about whether 
and how these status lenses change over time. 
Is it possible that Treiman was correct in the 
mid-twentieth century when he argued for the 
existence of a singular, discriminating consen-
sus lens, but that other status lenses have 
emerged since then as the United States has 
become more diverse but also more unequal? 
Looking forward, one question is whether 
other aspects of social structure—such as po-
litical affiliation, due to increasing political po-
larization—will also become salient factors 
that shape our view of the occupational hierar-
chy (see Koenig 2022). In addition, researchers 
should consider the behavioral consequences 
of different status lenses, particularly in the 
realm of status attainment. For example, we 
can imagine that having a discriminating sta-
tus lens might restrict the range of occupa-
tional and educational aspirations an adoles-
cent develops or the occupational mobility they 
ultimately pursue throughout their career tra-
jectory; relatedly, having a dissensus status lens 
might make it more difficult for individuals to 
realize their aspirations accordingly (Harding 
2007; Frye and Trinitapoli 2015). These are also 
critical questions for future research.

Finally, scholars of status have more re-
cently argued for the importance of third-order 
status beliefs: a foundational aspect of status 
is not just what people believe is high or low 
status, but what people believe the generalized 
other believes about status (Correll et al. 2017; 
Melamed et al. 2019). Indeed, third-order be-
liefs about status lead to stereotype threat, in 
which a stigmatized group often carries a psy-
chological burden of having to navigate a world 
in which the status order has been decided by 
those in positions of power—even though they 
themselves may not hold that belief (for a re-
view, see Spencer, Logel, and Davies 2016). The 
current GSS data on occupational prestige rat-
ings cannot disentangle first-order status be-
liefs from third-order status beliefs: are people 
rating occupations based on what they think is 
a high-status job, or are they rating them based 

on what they think most other people think is 
a high-status job—regardless of their own 
views? Indeed, we cannot know whether part 
of the dissensus observed among racial minor-
ities, low-education, and low-income groups is 
due to the fact that some may be reporting first-
order status beliefs and some may be reporting 
third-order status beliefs. This vital question 
requires researchers to collect data on occupa-
tional status beliefs that is different than the 
way we have gathered prestige data for the past 
near-century.

A cross-disciplinary line of inquiry has es-
tablished the many micro, meso, and macro 
domains in which social status impacts our life 
chances (see Ridgeway 2019; Fiske and Markus 
2012). A person’s occupational status is known 
to influence their stress level (Matthews et al. 
2000), body mass index (McLaren and Godley 
2012), cancer risk (Behrens et al. 2016), mortal-
ity rate (Christ et al. 2012), as well as their chil-
dren’s educational outcomes (Conley and 
Yeung 2005), above and beyond their material 
resources. Yet this study’s cultural cognitive ap-
proach to status beliefs has demonstrated so-
cial patterning in status lenses, suggesting that 
these status beliefs are not necessarily widely 
shared. This means that existing work using oc-
cupational prestige as a measure of status is 
likely incomplete, given that standard occupa-
tional prestige scores use trimmed means of 
these ratings, erasing any systematic differ-
ences between social groups in these status 
perceptions (see Smith and Son 2014). Further-
more, status lenses are likely a driver of inter-
actional inequality in the United States because 
the rewards of status are allocated based on the 
status lens of those closest to the traditional 
centers of power—men, Whites, the college ed-
ucated, and the higher earning. These groups, 
in essence, create and enforce the rules of the 
game by making decisions on the basis of a sta-
tus order that others do not necessarily hold. 
Acknowledging and even acquiring a different 
status lens may help equalize these status ef-
fects and allocate the rewards of status in a 
more just way.
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Table A.1. Log Linear Approach to Modeling Sensitivity-Discrimination

Model 1 Model 2

Female .183*** (.038) .164*** (.039)
Blacka .206*** (.055) .186** (.059)
Hispanica –.086 (.123) –.089 (.128)
Asiana –.012 (.121) –.031 (.126)
Other racea .160 (.216) .127 (.216)
Education (years) –.028*** (.007) –.024** (.008)
Income (logged) –.040** (.013) –.041** (.014)
Age –.001 (.001) –.002 (.001)
Working full time –.065 (.045)
Prestige score of own job .000 (.002)
Constant 1.932*** (.174) 1.983*** (.184)
Ballot controls? Yes Yes
N 927 903

Source: Author’s calculations.
Note: The log linear approach linearly regresses a logged outcome on the covariates. Unsurprisingly, this 
model violates the nonnormality assumption of OLS, as evidenced by the significant Shapiro-Wilk test  
(p < .001), as well as visual inspections of the residuals, so it is not preferred over the Poisson model in this 
case. Nevertheless, it produces very similar results to the Poisson approach in table 2.
a Reference group is Whites.
* p < .05; ** p < .01; *** p < .001 (two-tailed tests)  

Table A.2. Generalized Negative Binomial Approach to Modeling Sensitivity-Discrimination

Model 1 Model 2

Female 3.170* (1.528) 2.216*** (.544)
Blacka 1.367*** (.117) 1.173*** (.113)
Hispanica b b

Asiana b b

Other racea b b

Education (years) –.192*** (.020) –.125*** (.022)
Income (logged) –.104** (.031) –.141*** (.029)
Age –.014*** (.004) –.015*** (.003)
Working full time –.244 (.138)
Prestige score of own job –.028*** (.005)
Constant –2.955 (1.622) –1.108
Ballot controls? Yes Yes
N 80,765 78,773

Source: Author’s calculations.
Note: Generalized negative binomial models allow for the simultaneous estimation of the mean and disper-
sion parameters as a function of some vector of covariates. Results presented here model the mean pres-
tige rating as a function of ballot (“ballot controls,” results for which are not shown here to conserve space), 
and the dispersion in prestige ratings as a function of respondent-level independent variables (the results 
shown in table A.2). This model requires estimation on the full ratings dataset, as indicated by the very 
large sample size. Results are also very consistent with results from the Poisson regression approach.
a Reference group is Whites. 
b Cell size is too small to produce reliable estimate using this estimation approach.
*p < .05; ** p < .01; *** p < .001 (two-tailed tests)  
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Figure A.3. Predicted Values for Kendall’s tau (a) by Social Group

Source: Author’s calculations.
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Figure A.4. Predicted Values for Kendall’s tau (b) by Social Group

Source: Author’s calculations.
Taken together, Figures A.1 through A.4 demonstrate that results presented for dy-
adic correlations of rank orderings are not sensitive to the measure of ordinal cor-
relation used because they are consistent across all three measures (Spearman’s 
ρ, Kendall’s τ a and Kendall’s τ b).
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