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Why did the Coleman Report and the decades of education research that it influenced not result in greater 
reductions in educational inequality? What can be done to ensure that future education research is more ef-
fective in this respect? This paper describes the significant disconnect between education researchers and 
policymakers, characterized by three problems: (1) researchers do not inform policymakers about the results 
of their research, (2) policymakers do not inform researchers about their policy goals, and (3) when policy-
makers and researchers do exchange information, they often do so in a highly political context in which 
many interests supersede the interests of students. However, important changes since the Coleman Report 
have created a context more conducive to effective collaboration, including a nationwide movement among 
researchers, policymakers, and funders to create more meaningful and effective partnerships. These changes 
present a unique opportunity for improving the connection between research and policy and reducing edu-
cational inequities over the next fifty years.
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Connecting 
Research and 
Policy

tantly, what can be done to ensure that current 
and future education research has a greater im-
pact?

This paper focuses on the significant dis-
connect that persists between education re-
search and policy, despite repeated efforts to 
bring the two together. First, I briefly describe 
the persistent gaps and the role of researchers 
and policymakers in maintaining them. Sec-
ond, I describe the political context that im-
pedes an effective connection between re-
searchers and policymakers. Third, I describe 
some important changes that have created a 
better context for improving the connection 
between research and policy, including an em-
phasis on evidence-based decision-making 
with a local focus, funders’ initiatives that sup-
port a movement away from the traditional 

Commissioned by Congress in the Civil Rights 
Act of 1964, James Coleman’s seminal work on 
educational inequality was the most ambitious 
national study on the condition of education 
to date, and not surprisingly, it had a tremen-
dous influence on decades of education re-
search that followed. However, as the papers 
in this issue have shown, educational inequi-
ties by race, ethnicity, and economic status 
stubbornly persist, despite countless research 
studies and the expenditure of many millions 
of research dollars. Significant victories en-
sued, but many researchers and policymakers 
would agree that educational inequalities and 
inequities have not been reduced sufficiently. 
Why did the Coleman Report and the decades 
of research that it influenced not result in 
more significant gap closures? More impor-
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academic research model toward a partnership 
research model, and changing institutional in-
centives for academic researchers. These im-
portant changes are promoting a political con-
text quite different from what existed fifty years 
ago—one that is primed for much better col-
laboration between researchers and decision-
makers. Finally, this paper ends with several 
recommended approaches to seizing this mo-
ment to improve the connection between re-
search and policy and reduce educational in-
equities over the next fifty years.

Persistent Gaps in Educational 
Att ainment
Although educational attainment has improved 
over time for all groups, progress in closing the 
gaps between groups has stalled, and even re-
gressed, relative to when we began document-
ing gaps with national assessment data in the 
early 1970s. All racial groups have experienced 
improvements in high school and college com-
pletion, but gaps between these groups remain 
significant. For example, the black-white high 
school completion gap declined sharply during 
the 1970s and 1980s, but the decline since then 
has been much slower and the black-white gap 
in college completion has actually grown since 
1970, and sharply so since 1995 (National Cen-
ter for Education Statistics 2013). In terms of 
income, achievement gaps based on the Na-
tional Assessment of Educational Progress 
(NAEP) have grown significantly over the last 
three decades. For example, the reading achieve-
ment gap between the top and bottom 10 per-
cent of the income distribution has increased 
substantially, from 0.9 of a standard deviation 
among those born in the 1950s, 1960s, and 
early 1970s to 1.25 standard deviations among 
those born just twenty to twenty-five years later 
(Reardon 2013). Finally, combining income and 
race for all school districts in the United States, 
sixth-graders in the richest districts are about 
four grade levels ahead of children in the poor-
est districts, and within districts there are very 
large gaps between white, black, and Hispanic 
students in a majority of districts across the 
country (Reardon, Kalogrides, and Shores 2016).

These persistent gaps surprised some astute 
observers of educational inequality. Adam 
Gamoran (2001) had optimistically predicted 

that inequality in educational achievement 
and attainment would remain stable by socio-
economic status but diminish by race because 
successes in one generation, he predicted, 
would produce even greater successes in the 
next generation. I was equally hopeful about 
this “virtuous cycle,” but it did not take hold 
as expected. More recently, Gamoran (2015) has 
explained that a primary reason for this disap-
pointment is that educational and socioeco-
nomic gains do not pay off as well for blacks 
as they do for whites. This was corroborated by 
a study from the Federal Reserve Bank of St. 
Louis, which reported that although African 
Americans and Hispanics with four-year col-
lege degrees had a higher income and a much 
higher net worth in 2013 than those without 
degrees, between 1992 and 2013 the median 
real net worth of college-educated African 
Americans and Hispanics dropped by 56 and 
27 percent, respectively, while the median real 
net worth of college-educated whites and Asian 
Americans increased by 86 and 90 percent, re-
spectively, during the same time period (Em-
mons and Noeth 2015). These disparities in as-
set gains and losses have a substantial impact 
on the resources transferred from one genera-
tion to the next.

There are multiple reasons for the impeded 
progress in reducing inequality, but an impor-
tant one, I propose, stems from the underlying 
disconnect between education research and 
policy. This disconnect is characterized by 
three problems: (1) researchers do not inform 
policymakers about their results, (2) policy-
makers do not inform researchers about their 
policy goals, and (3) when policymakers and 
researchers do exchange information with 
each other, it is often done in a highly political 
context in which many interests supersede the 
interests of students. As a result, not all aca-
demic researchers and policymakers believe 
that research should be used for policymaking, 
given the many dangers associated with re-
search manipulation and the possibility that 
studies that do not support a preexisting view-
point will be excluded. Although these dangers 
are real, I assert that research should be used 
for policymaking and that steps can be taken 
to promote its proper use. Under the right con-
ditions, research can be an extremely informa-
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tive tool for policymaking, it can help to secure 
resources for implementing effective policy, 
and it can even help to generate political will.

The Disconnect Betw een 
Education Rese arch and Policy
Although education researchers and policy-
makers often work together—as with the 
Coleman Report, which was commissioned by 
Congress—they are not typically linked in a 
manner that is conducive for collective impact. 
Three conditions foster this disconnect be-
tween research and policy: (1) academic re-
searchers generally focus on informing other 
researchers of their results rather than decision-
makers; (2) decision-makers generally do not 
have easy access to timely, context-specific re-
search to inform their decision-making; and 
(3) decision-makers generally do not inform 
researchers of their research needs and some-
times even make data access difficult for re-
searchers interested in analyzing their data. Ie 
consider each of these conditions in turn.

First, academic researchers typically have 
few or no incentives to take measures to ensure 
that decision-makers use their work. Instead, 
they are largely rewarded for publishing their 
work with the most prestigious academic pub-
lishers or in the most cited academic journals, 
which are read primarily by other academics, 
not by decision-makers. Many institutions 
even frown upon applied work, deeming it not 
as worthy as the intellectual pursuit of interest-
ing questions without regard for what is popu-
lar at the moment. Basic research is certainly 
important and should continue, and publish-
ing in academic journals should also continue, 
especially because the blind review process 
pushes authors to improve and polish their 
work in ways that they would not do otherwise. 
However, research universities should recog-
nize and reward efforts to apply research in set-
tings that could really benefit from it, such as 
state and local education agencies, and aca-
demics should not make publishing in aca-
demic journals their end goal but instead take 
additional steps to ensure that their research 
actually informs decision-makers.

Second, decision-makers in state and local 
education agencies often do not have access to 
academic research publications, as access can 

be very expensive. Even if they do, they gener-
ally do not have time to read lengthy research 
articles to stay current on the research litera-
ture, and they are hesitant to use research con-
ducted in other regions with different popula-
tions. Also, decision-makers in school districts 
and state agencies often do not have adequate 
staff and resources to conduct their own re-
search. Even urban school districts large enough 
to have their own research departments are 
typically understaffed and have to focus on re-
porting requirements rather than large-scale 
studies that could be used for decision-making 
and tackling long-standing problems. Further-
more, decision-makers often need access to in-
dependently produced research, as in-house 
research that reports favorable results is some-
times dismissed or viewed with skepticism by 
the public.

Finally, state and local policymakers gener-
ally do not inform researchers of their research 
needs and sometimes even make data access 
difficult for researchers interested in analyzing 
their data. The sensitive nature of student and 
teacher data certainly requires that data access 
be restricted, and education agencies must 
take security measures to protect their constit-
uents’ identities. However, the dangers associ-
ated with not sharing data are much greater 
than the dangers associated with doing so. 
With protective measures in place, data shar-
ing greatly increases research capacity and cap-
italizes on the expertise of external research-
ers. Furthermore, data owners can and should 
place expectations on researchers to produce 
research that is timely and useful for the edu-
cation agency providing the data. They can in-
form researchers of their most urgent research 
needs, they can request research briefs and 
presentations designed to inform their decision-
makers, and they can request meetings to dis-
cuss research results, limitations, and implica-
tions.

The Impediments of the  
Political Conte x t
Although education researchers and policy-
makers do work together sometimes, they are 
not typically linked in a manner that is condu-
cive to collective impact. When policymakers 
and researchers do work together, they must 
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often contend with a highly political context 
in which many interests compete for their at-
tention besides the interests of students. 
Those interests, such as job security, career ad-
vancement, and access to funding, apply 
equally to policymakers and researchers, as 
well as to many other stakeholders. Policymak-
ers additionally have to contend with impor-
tant constituents such as boards, state and lo-
cal organizations, and influential parents who 
do not necessarily have in mind the interests 
of all students.

For example, a task force in one of Hous-
ton’s poorest neighborhoods produced a re-
port highlighting a substantial inequity in the 
student funding formula, which allocated sig-
nificantly more funding for gifted and talented 
(GT) students than for economically disadvan-
taged students (Fifth Ward Education Task 
Force 2016). The report suggested changing the 
weighted pupil formula, which accounted for 
90 percent of each school’s budget and allotted 
a modest weight of 7.5 percent for low-income 
students but a much greater weight of 12 per-
cent for GT students, who were disproportion-
ately higher-income, white, and concentrated 
in specific schools. When this funding inequity 
was brought to the attention of the district’s 
leadership, they acted upon it quickly, but they 
had to figure out a way to avoid provoking the 
influential parents of the higher-income, GT 
students. The acting superintendent’s original 
proposal would have cut the amount of fund-
ing that schools received for GT students in 
half, but that was not politically feasible. The 
revised proposal therefore redirected funds for 
the poorest schools without touching the fund-
ing for GT students. The newspaper headline 
highlighted this choice: “HISD [Houston Inde-
pendent School District] Chief Scraps Plan to 
Cut Gifted Student Funding” (Mellon 2016). Af-
ter the headline and the first sentence, the rest 
of the article described the acting superinten-
dent’s plan to redirect $21 million to the poor-
est schools. The revised plan was later ap-
proved with a unanimous school board vote, 
and the subsequent headline read: “HISD Ap-
proves Spending Plan Favoring Schools with 
Most Low-Income Students” (Wermund 2016). 
Although redirecting $21 million is no small 
feat, it is not a sustainable solution given that 

the inequitable funding formula remained the 
same in order to appease the influential par-
ents of GT students and avoid further white 
flight from the district, whose student body is 
only 8 percent white.

Another important interest that can super-
sede the interests of students is job security, 
which, for policymakers at all levels, is often 
tenuous: many policymakers must either be 
reelected or reappointed or have their con-
tracts renewed. They are therefore under high 
pressure to perform quickly during their term 
in leadership, and they must please many pow-
erful constituents, some of whom could expe-
dite their termination. These conditions are 
important for accountability purposes, but 
they are not conducive to long-term planning 
or policies or interventions that might take 
years to produce desired results. Similarly, the 
pressure on many researchers, especially un-
tenured faculty or researchers seeking career 
advancement, to produce academic reports re-
quires that they pursue research questions that 
are interesting to the broader research com-
munity (and not necessarily to local decision-
makers) and that their results be interesting or 
surprising (which can reduce incentives for 
replication or for publishing studies with in-
significant results); for these researchers, the 
policy implications are often an afterthought. 
All of these interests make it difficult for edu-
cation researchers and policymakers to work 
together effectively.

While education researchers and state and 
local policymakers struggle to connect in a 
meaningful way, vendors of textbooks, soft-
ware, and curricula often do a much better job 
than academic researchers of disseminating 
research directly to decision-makers in school 
districts and state education agencies. Because 
that research, often produced and funded by 
these vendors of educational products them-
selves, is more likely to report favorable results 
(Borman et al. 2003), these local decision-
makers need more access to independently 
produced, timely, context-specific research. 
Other sources of funding, such as federal agen-
cies and private foundations, fund indepen-
dently produced research, but their funding 
often does not support the cost of an effective 
partnership infrastructure. Many resources—
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not just financial—are needed to bring to-
gether researchers and decision-makers to 
jointly develop a research agenda, build com-
patible research structures, and conduct and 
disseminate research findings in a direct and 
effective manner. Fortunately, the context for 
creating more meaningful connections be-
tween researchers and decision-makers is im-
proving.

The Changing Conte x t
Despite numerous challenges to an effective 
connection between researchers and policy-
makers, several important changes have oc-
curred since the release of the Coleman Re-
port. Today’s political context is quite different 
from that of fifty years ago and is primed for 
much better collaboration between education 
researchers and decision-makers, which I be-
lieve can more effectively reduce inequalities 
and inequities. These changes include: (1) in-
creased emphasis on local decision-making, 
coupled with a nationwide movement among 
researchers, policymakers, and funders to cre-
ate more meaningful and effective place-based 
partnerships; (2) changing institutional incen-
tives for both academic researchers and lead-
ers at state and local education agencies; and 
(3) technological advances in data science. 
These changes present a unique opportunity 
for improving the connection between re-
search and policy and reducing educational in-
equities over the next fifty years.

The nationwide movement to create more 
meaningful relationships among researchers, 
policymakers, and funders has been in the 
making for several decades, but an emphasis 
on place-based partnerships did not begin un-
til around 1990, with the founding of the Chi-
cago Consortium on School Research (CCSR 
2015). This model spread slowly at first, but 
quickly took off in the last decade as similar 
place-based partnerships between research in-
stitutions and local education agencies began 
to form in other large urban areas, such as  
the Baltimore Education Research Consortium 
(BERC), launched in 2006; the Research Alli-
ance for New York City Schools, launched in 
2008; the Stanford University and San Francisco 
Unified School District Partnership, launched 

in 2009; the Los Angeles Education Research 
Institute (LAERI), launched in 2011; the Hous-
ton Education Research Consortium (HERC), 
launched in 2011; the Education Research Alli-
ance for New Orleans (ERANO), launched in 
2013; and Shared Solutions in Philadelphia, 
launched in 2014. Although each of these part-
nerships has distinct features relevant to its 
local context, they share a primary aim to con-
nect research and policy in a manner that pro-
motes collective impact.

Along with the formation of these partner-
ships, a developing new field of research has 
added theoretical and methodological depth 
to partnership work, starting with Maureen 
Hallinan’s (1996, 2011) plea for researchers to 
adopt a more practical approach in order to be 
more effective. Meredith Honig and Cynthia 
Coburn (2008) have helped researchers under-
stand the different meanings of “evidence” 
and the complicated ways in which policymak-
ers use it, and Anthony Bryk, Louis Gomez, 
and Alicia Grunow (2011) have promoted a 
problem-centered, sustained research infra-
structure that cultivates a diversity of expertise 
so that research and development do not oc- 
cur apart from an applied setting but rather 
through a “networked improvement commu-
nity.” In particular, Melissa Roderick, John 
Easton, and Penny Sebring (2012) argue that 
developing new roles for research is increas-
ingly important as decision-making becomes 
more decentralized. All of these insights have 
helped to move the nascent field of research-
practice partnerships forward, especially local 
place-based partnerships.

The spread of these partnerships and the 
accompanying development of the new re-
search field reached a critical point with the 
passing of the Every Student Succeeds Act 
(ESSA) of 2015—the most recent reauthoriza-
tion of the Elementary and Secondary Educa-
tion Act (ESEA) of 1965. ESSA is in many ways 
a response to the lessons learned from the pre-
vious reauthorization, the No Child Left Be-
hind (NCLB) Act of 2001. Among the lessons 
learned from NCLB was the need for a much 
stronger commitment to supporting the use  
of evidence in local decision-making. The 
evidence-based movement was already well 
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under way in 2001, but recent developments 
would provide resources for research and eval-
uation as well as increase state and local power 
to act upon that evidence. Specifically, ESSA 
will:

•	 establish new resources to test promising 
practices and replicate proven strategies 
that will drive opportunity and better out-
comes for America’s students; and

•	 empower state and local decision-makers 
to develop their own strong systems for 
school improvement based upon evidence, 
rather than imposing cookie-cutter federal 
solutions, as No Child Left Behind (NCLB) 
did.

This commitment to the provision of resources 
for research, combined with increased state 
and local power to act upon that evidence, epit-
omizes the increasingly widespread emphasis 
on local decision-making, which is more con-
ducive to collaboration between researchers 
and decision-makers.

National data provide useful benchmarks, 
but state and school district decision-makers 
want to use timely, context-specific evidence, 
based on questions they helped to develop. The 
national-level evidence provided by the Cole-
man Report may have been suitable for gaug-
ing the nation’s inequalities and inequities, 
but it was not useful for local decision-making. 
The current evidence-based movement focuses 
on the power of evidence in local decision-
making, which I believe is a more effective 
strategy for reducing inequality owing to the 
buy-in generated when local decision-makers 
and researchers collaborate on a long-term 
basis. In particular, local decision-making fa-
cilitates the development of a joint research 
agenda, which is an iterative process that re-
quires extensive and frequent communication 
between local researchers and decision-makers. 
Most importantly, a jointly developed research 
agenda in turn increases the likelihood of 
aligning the timing of research with the timing 
of decision-making. 

Another important change for researcher–
decision-maker collaboration is taking place 
among the agencies and foundations that fund 
education research and education initiatives. 
Funders of education initiatives are more often 
stressing the need for external evaluations,  
and funders of education research are putting 
greater emphasis on the need for deeper col-
laborations with the education agencies in-
volved. Funders are developing new requests 
for proposals that specifically require these 
types of collaborations to facilitate a thorough 
and strategic dissemination process that will 
directly inform decision-makers. Funders are 
also increasingly collaborating with one an-
other to develop funding strategies that will 
enable them to accomplish more together than 
could be accomplished alone. For example, the 
Education Funder Strategy Group (EFSG), a 
group of about thirty foundations that meet 
quarterly, aims to create “systemic improve-
ments in student learning and outcomes” by, 
among other goals, “building capacity and eq-
uity into the [public education] system to fully 
serve all students.”1 These foundations are 
leaders in a movement to support research that 
is not only rigorous but also impactful. This 
movement, which is spreading to other foun-
dations, is critical for convincing researchers 
and decision-makers to work together in mean-
ingful ways.

Unfortunately, the actors that have been 
slowest to join these important movements have 
been research universities. Although some re-
search universities are developing criteria to 
recognize and reward applied research, there 
is still tremendous pressure on academic re-
searchers to focus exclusively on academic 
publications, which can take years to produce 
and typically are not read by decision-makers. 
Most research universities place much less 
weight on other works that could convey infor-
mation to decision-makers more directly, such 
as research briefs for school district leaders, 
newspaper articles for the general public, and 
presentations or research memos for state 
leaders. Furthermore, some academic publish-

1. See the mission statement of the National Public Education Support Fund as it relates to the EFSG at: http://
www.npesf.org/education-funder-strategy-group (accessed June 28, 2016).
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ers refuse to publish research that has already 
been publicized heavily. For these reasons, ac-
ademic researchers have few incentives to in-
vest a lot of effort in working with decision-
makers through long-term alliances.

However, some universities are starting to 
recognize that reaching out to decision-makers 
can have many benefits, including more op-
portunities for securing funding (given the 
funders’ strategies mentioned earlier) and an 
improved public image that attracts donors 
who value research with direct societal impact. 
Support from their university administration 
is crucial if academic researchers are to col-
laborate effectively with local decision-makers. 
For example, Rice University has been ex-
tremely supportive of my own efforts to col-
laborate with local decision-makers, including 
assistance in setting up formal partnerships, 
securing data-sharing agreements, and devel-
oping relationships with key leaders. If institu-
tions like Rice take the lead in demonstrating 
to other institutions the value of this type of 
work, I believe that research universities  
can play an important role in changing the 
academic incentives for collaborating with 
decision-makers.

Advances in data science have been another 
crucial development in facilitating researcher–
decision-maker collaboration. Although still 
an emerging field, these recent technological 
advances have much to offer education re-
searchers that enables them to collaborate ef-
fectively with a variety of community partners 
as well as other researchers. Of particular use 
is the capacity to store extremely large amounts 
of data, from multiple databases that can com-
municate with each other, and in a manner 
that is secure yet easily accessible to approved 
users. Rice University recently invested $150 
million in data science initiatives, and the 
Kinder Institute for Urban Research at Rice is 
building an urban data platform with spatial 
data architecture that will serve as a single ac-
cess point for over 2,000 data sets maintained 
by the City of Houston, the Houston Indepen-

dent School District, community organiza-
tions, and other partners.2

Not only are these data science develop-
ments enabling researchers and decision-
makers to share data more easily and produce 
faster and timelier results, but they are also 
facilitating the development of new research 
methodologies and tools, such as machine 
learning, statistical learning, and better data 
visualization. With these developments in data 
science, state and school district leaders can 
store more information, including more gran-
ular data; they can more easily transfer sensi-
tive data to researchers while minimizing se-
curity risks; and researchers can link more 
databases to open up new lines of research and 
apply new methodologies that require massive 
amounts of data. For example, many school 
districts had not been storing application data 
from job candidates who were not hired, owing 
to the cost associated with data storage. With-
out this information, researchers cannot study 
applicant pool changes over time or teacher 
selection, recruitment, and retention processes, 
which are associated with inequalities in stu-
dent outcomes and are more challenging in 
some schools than in others (Jacob 2007). How-
ever, with improved and less expensive data 
storage technology, school districts can store 
unselected job candidates’ information over a 
period of time. Furthermore, if school districts 
across a geographic region do this, researchers 
can study these processes across a regional job 
market, as neighboring districts often compete 
for job candidates.

These developments have created a context 
for researcher–decision-maker collaboration 
very different from the context of fifty years ago. 
The national movement to create more mean-
ingful partnerships, the increased emphasis on 
local evidence-based decision-making, funders’ 
initiatives to promote researcher–decision-
maker collaboration, the changing institu-
tional incentives for academic researchers, and 
the technological advances in data science 
have all created a context primed for a deeper 

2. Jade Boyd, “Rice Announces $150 Million in Strategic Research Initiatives,” Rice University News & Media, 
September 21, 2015, available at: http://news.rice.edu/2015/09/21/rice-announces-150-million-in-strategic 
-research-initiatives/ (accessed June 28, 2016).
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and more effective connection between re-
search and policy. I believe that the following 
approaches could seize this moment and re-
duce inequality over the next fifty years.

Approaches to Reducing 
Educational Inequalit y
In response to the stalled progress in reducing 
educational inequalities and inequities, I pro-
pose three practical approaches that capitalize 
on the changes taking place that facilitate a 
more effective connection between research 
and policy. The three approaches focus on lo-
cal, regional, and national measures to reduce 
educational inequities, and they all leverage a 
partnership research model. Local measures 
can help schools with high concentrations of 
disadvantaged students improve educational 
outcomes, regional measures can integrate 
schools and school districts in the long run, 
and national measures can support the devel-
opment of local partnerships and facilitate 
work across partnerships.

Schools with high concentrations of disad-
vantaged students have become increasingly 
common and simply cannot continue to func-
tion in the same way. For example, students in 
these schools have lower access to teachers 
with higher value-added scores, which are as-
sociated with student achievement, especially 
in math and science (Lauen and Henry 2015). 
It is therefore important to understand how 
these schools function and how best to help 
students in very challenging contexts. At the 
same time, we must figure out how to disband 
the high concentrations of disadvantaged stu-
dents in order for schooling processes to be 
more effective and, most importantly, to take 
up the work of reducing educational inequal-
ity.

Approach 1: Local Measures
Education researchers regularly interact with 
schools and school districts and even refer to 
these collaborations as “partnerships,” but 
these collaborations typically are researcher-
centered, are limited to the duration of a study 

or project, and yield academic publications 
that rarely benefit the schools involved (Turley 
and Stevens 2015). These collaborations are 
based on a traditional academic research model, 
which emphasizes researcher-developed ques-
tions, site selection based on those questions, 
and the dissemination of research findings pri-
marily to other academics. As a result, aca-
demic researchers have limited involvement in 
informing policy and practice in school dis-
tricts, and school district leaders have limited 
involvement in shaping research agendas at 
research institutions (Turley and Stevens 2015). 
In an effort to address this problem, research-
practice partnerships (RPPs) apply a part
nership research model, which focuses on de
veloping a long-term alliance rather than a 
project-based collaboration, place-based re-
search agendas that are developed jointly by 
researchers and decision-makers, and a dis-
semination process that prioritizes conveying 
information to decision-makers.3

There are many advantages to the partner-
ship research model. Most importantly, this 
model is more likely to produce research that 
will actually be used by education decision-
makers because that is its goal at the outset. 
To begin with, a jointly developed research 
agenda ensures that the research produced is 
relevant to the potential users of the research 
results because they play a direct role in devel-
oping the research questions. Developing an 
agenda jointly requires early and frequent 
communication, in the recognition that it is 
an iterative process that must include multiple 
perspectives and ongoing equal ownership  
of the agenda. Combining the expertise of 
decision-makers who can identify the most 
pressing questions with the expertise of re-
searchers who can incorporate the broader lit-
erature produces research projects that are rel-
evant and of great interest to decision-makers, 
most of whom will eagerly await the research 
results.

Another significant advantage to RPPs is 
that they produce local, context-specific re-
search. Besides their lack of easy access to aca-

3. See William T. Grant Foundation, “Research-Practice Partnerships,” available at: http://wtgrantfoundation 
.org/RPP.
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demic journals, and the time to read them, an 
important reason why decision-makers do not 
use available research is that it is usually pro-
duced at a different location with which their 
district may not have much in common. Some-
times research sites are not identifiable in re-
search publications, and even if they are iden-
tified and happen to have some similarities to 
local decision-makers’ schools and districts, 
there is no guarantee that what worked at the 
research site will work elsewhere, given the 
ever-present problem of unmeasured factors. 
In addition, school district leaders must use 
the most recent data available because districts 
change rapidly, but by the time articles or 
books are published the data are several years 
old. For these reasons, local decision-makers 
are much more likely to make use of timely, 
local research because they can be assured that 
the evidence they are using is directly relevant 
to their context. This is particularly important 
for districts with high concentrations of disad-
vantaged students, in which schooling pro-
cesses function very differently—an issue I re-
turn to shortly.

Another advantage of RPPs is that their dis-
semination process is much more effective. A 
common understanding of research dissemi-
nation among academic researchers is that it 
is unidirectional and occurs after the comple-
tion of a research project, but this is highly 
ineffective for local decision-makers. The dis-
semination process should be more like a two-
way dialogue that begins before the study be-
gins, continues throughout the course of the 
study, and culminates in a series of discussions 
about the study’s findings, implications, and 
limitations (Tseng 2013). The joint develop-
ment of research questions ensures that the 
research is relevant and of interest to the po-
tential users, but the dissemination process 
continues throughout the study, as researchers 
and decision-makers meet regularly through-
out the course of the study so that district lead-
ers can respond to researchers’ questions and 
researchers can inform them of what to expect 
before the findings are released—what is often 
referred to as the “no surprises” rule. For ex-
ample, the Houston Education Research Con-

sortium, the partnership between Rice Univer-
sity and the Houston Independent School 
District, holds weekly research team meetings 
that district leaders are invited to attend, either 
via videoconference or in person. After the 
completion of the study, researchers do not 
simply hand over a written report but meet 
with decision-makers to answer questions and 
discuss the study’s main findings, limitations, 
and implications. This type of dissemination 
process requires a much larger time commit-
ment by both researchers and decision-makers, 
but it yields better research and significantly 
increases the chances that the research will ac-
tually be used.

Finally, because RPPs are designed to be 
long-term, they have the advantage of facilitat-
ing important follow-up studies that help dis-
tricts learn, for example, why an intervention 
did not work as planned. When an interven-
tion does not work, determining whether the 
failure was due to an ineffective intervention 
or an effective intervention with ineffective im-
plementation can be extremely challenging. 
Through long-term partnerships, researchers 
and district leaders can work together not only 
to study what works but also to learn how to 
make interventions work when they do not, 
whether by altering the interventions or alter-
ing the implementation of the intervention. 
For example, in its evaluation of a program for 
struggling readers using a regression disconti-
nuity design, HERC found that it was not hav-
ing the desired effect. The consortium recom-
mended a change in the program’s eligibility 
requirements in order to exclude the students 
near the test score cut-point, because there was 
evidence that the program was not helping 
these students. This change allowed the dis-
trict to focus its resources on the students 
more likely to be helped by the program, and 
it allowed HERC to do a follow-up study to test 
the program’s effectiveness for students in a 
different part of the test score distribution.4 

By connecting research and policy in this 
manner, policymakers and researchers can 
work together to identify and implement effec-
tive tools for helping schools and districts with 
high concentrations of disadvantaged stu-

4. The HERC research briefs are available at: https://kinder.rice.edu/herc/.
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dents. However, local efforts are not sufficient 
for addressing the larger need to improve eco-
nomic and racial-ethnic integration, because 
segregation occurs primarily between rather 
than within school districts (Stroub and Rich-
ards 2013). As a result, efforts coordinated 
through regional and national measures are 
needed in order to disband high concentrations 
of disadvantaged students and help schools 
function more effectively. Improving economic 
and racial-ethnic integration is a necessary 
part of reducing inequality.

Approach 2: Regional Measures
Although local partnerships can produce work 
that informs integration policy, such as district 
magnet school programs that aim to integrate 
students, the level of integration they can 
achieve is limited by the fact that segregation 
occurs primarily between rather than within 
school districts. Kori Stroub and Meredith 
Richards (2013) estimate that almost two-thirds 
of multiracial segregation occurs between dis-
tricts and only one-third occurs within dis-
tricts. Furthermore, between-district segrega-
tion is highest in fragmented metropolitan 
areas, where a central city district is sur-
rounded by a large number of smaller districts 
(Bischoff 2008). This means that significant 
changes in segregation can only take place at 
the regional level and that the greatest oppor-
tunity for change is in fragmented metropoli-
tan areas.

There are clear patterns by race and socio-
economic status, for example, in my own re-
gion, the Houston Independent School District 
and neighboring Houston-area school dis-
tricts. HISD, the largest district in Texas and 
the seventh-largest in the United States, is only 
8.2 percent white, and 75.5 percent of students 
are economically disadvantaged, according to 
the 2014–2015 online district profile. In con-
trast, neighboring districts northwest of HISD 
are significantly whiter and less economically 
disadvantaged: 27.5 percent white and 49.7 per-
cent economically disadvantaged in Cypress-
Fairbanks; 40.9 percent white and 29.0 percent 
low-income in Katy; and 57.3 percent white and 
24.5 percent economically disadvantaged in 
Tomball. Intradistrict efforts cannot integrate 
schools, especially if the district’s student pop-

ulation is only 8 percent white, as is the case 
with HISD. Redistributing the few white stu-
dents in HISD will not significantly alter the 
racial composition of the district’s schools.

Local RPPs can play an important role in 
integration, but they must coordinate their ef-
forts across partnerships, especially those in 
their region, in order to achieve macrolevel 
changes in segregation. School and district 
segregation matters a lot because a high con-
centration of disadvantaged students alters the 
functioning of campuses and districts (Rum-
berger and Palardy 2005). In schools and dis-
tricts with high concentrations of disadvan-
taged students, teacher and administrator 
recruitment and retention is more difficult, 
course offerings are more limited, parent in-
volvement is more challenging because of their 
limited time and resources, specialized pro-
grams that require parent organizing and 
fund-raising are nearly impossible, and reme-
diating interventions are often ineffective ow-
ing to a lack of human capital, leadership sta-
bility, and other important resources. As long 
as these resources, through segregation, are 
concentrated in some schools and are deficient 
or completely lacking in other schools, efforts 
to improve educational outcomes among dis-
advantaged students are Band-Aid solutions at 
best. Band-Aids are helpful in the short term 
and should of course be utilized, but only in 
conjunction with longer-term regional solu-
tions that aim to improve the integration of 
students.

There are some interdistrict collaboratives, 
such as in Rochester, Omaha, and Minneapolis 
(Finnigan et al. 2015). Some resulted from 
court orders or state laws, while others were 
voluntary, but regardless of their origins, these 
collaboratives have had very limited reach be-
cause they are choice-based and rely on the co-
operation of suburban schools to provide stu-
dent slots (Finnigan et al. 2015). Furthermore, 
these collaboratives are limited to districts and 
therefore lack the advantages of RPPs between 
districts and research institutions. In particu-
lar, regional RPP cooperation has the potential 
to inform region-specific decision-making to 
produce macrolevel changes such as improving 
economic and racial-ethnic integration. Intra-
district efforts cannot produce these changes, 
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nor can interdistrict efforts without locally in-
formed decision-making, based on timely, 
context-specific research.

Regional measures based on coordinated 
local RPP efforts are needed. Local knowledge 
can be synthesized at the regional level to pro-
duce measures to reduce inequality beyond 
what can be accomplished through local mea-
sures alone. Regional, interdistrict efforts in-
formed by local RPPs can address a variety of 
regional equity challenges and guide actions 
such as those aimed at improving economic 
and racial-ethnic integration. Regional mea-
sures can address other equity challenges as 
well, such as the inequitable distribution of 
highly qualified and effective teachers. There 
are large differences between the qualifica-
tions of teachers in the highest-poverty and 
highest-minority schools—who are often inex-
perienced, out-of-field, or uncertified—and the 
qualifications of teachers in low-poverty and 
low-minority schools (Peske and Haycock 
2006). Even when using value-added estimates 
in addition to experience and licensure exam 
scores, the distribution of teachers consis-
tently favors economically advantaged and 
nonminority students in elementary, middle, 
and high schools, and these inequities are 
found at the classroom, school, and district 
levels (Goldhaber, Theobald, and Tien 2015). 
Districts may attempt to recruit and retain 
highly qualified and effective teachers, but an 
equitable distribution can only be achieved at 
the regional level because teachers compare 
salaries, bonuses, and work conditions across 
districts in their region. For these reasons, 
these types of efforts to improve equality of 
educational opportunity are best carried out 
through the regional cooperation of local 
RPPs.

Approach 3: National Measures
National efforts are needed as well. The num-
ber of research-practice partnerships at this 
level is increasing, but there are relatively few 
such RPPs, many are fairly new, and they are 
challenging to develop and maintain, as they 
must be structured to endure frequent leader-
ship changes, funding fluctuations, and polit-
ical swings. A national infrastructure could 
support the development of these partner-

ships, facilitate their communication and col-
laboration, and coordinate efforts to connect 
research and policy at the local, regional, and 
national levels. Several national efforts to sup-
port RPPs are under way. For example, the In-
stitute of Education Sciences (IES) in 2013 be-
gan funding partnerships between research 
institutions and state or local education agen-
cies to carry out research on issues of high pri-
ority for the education agencies. Private foun-
dations have also increased their funding for 
research produced by these types of part
nerships. In addition, the National Network  
of Education Research-Practice Partnerships 
(NNERPP) was launched in 2016 to support the 
development of these partnerships. Housed at 
the Kinder Institute for Urban Research at Rice 
University, NNERPP aims to (1) develop and 
share best partnership practices, (2) synthesize 
findings and build knowledge, (3) facilitate 
and produce comparative research, and (4) ad-
vance broader policies and system reforms. 
These tasks, which I describe in greater detail 
in this section, are prohibitive for RPPs work-
ing in isolation, but efforts coordinated through 
a national network are much more likely to 
succeed in connecting research to policy and 
practice and reducing inequality. Broader co-
ordinated efforts will ensure that educational 
inequality is not only studied but also reduced.

First, NNERPP aims to develop and share best 
partnership practices. One reason why RPPs can 
be challenging to set up and difficult to main-
tain is that they require that participants have 
many skills in which researchers and district 
leaders typically are not trained. Although re-
searchers often collaborate with other research 
institutions, it is unusual for them to collabo-
rate with school districts in a long-term part-
nership, and these collaborations highlight the 
substantial organizational differences between 
research institutions and school districts. 
Members of these different institutions often 
are not fully aware of their extensive dissimi-
larities in terms of time lines, communication 
processes, and organizational structures, to 
cite only a few examples. Furthermore, when 
these partnerships are forged, it can be very 
difficult to maintain a proper balance of power 
between the partner institutions and the indi-
viduals involved.
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Since most RPPs are fairly new, effective 
partnership practices have only recently begun 
to be developed and documented. There is 
much need for more in-depth information 
about how to develop and sustain these often 
precarious partnerships, such as how to han-
dle frequent leadership changes and political 
swings, how to translate research into mean-
ingful action, how to make communication 
styles more compatible, and how to deal with 
partnership fatigue. The next step for RPPs is 
to develop best practices for overcoming the 
barriers—erected by both researchers and dis-
trict leaders—to using research evidence. For 
example, HERC researchers have significantly 
altered their research time lines in order to re-
lease research briefs prior to district budget 
decisions, and district leaders have altered 
their schedules in order to include research 
meetings to discuss evidence relevant to their 
decision-making. Information about the prac-
tices that improve the use of evidence is just 
beginning to be collected and documented. 
There is need for systematically collecting best 
practices from the full range of RPPs that now 
exist, and most importantly, there is great need 
for developing effective mechanisms for shar-
ing this knowledge and putting it into practice.

Second, NNERPP aims to synthesize findings 
and build knowledge. Although local RPPs have 
the distinct advantage of enabling researchers 
to report findings directly to decision-makers 
in a manner that maximizes their utility, dis-
trict leaders and researchers alike could also 
benefit from knowing more about the research 
practices and findings of other partnerships. 
Research produced by RPPs should be synthe-
sized in a manner that enables researchers and 
policymakers from all over the country to stra-
tegically build on that knowledge and use it to 
develop solutions. National meetings give edu-
cation researchers many opportunities to learn 
from one another, but there are few opportuni-
ties for district leaders to learn from one an-
other, and even fewer opportunities for district 
leaders and researchers to learn from each 
other. Professional organizations target these 
two groups separately, but there are few orga-
nizations that explicitly aim to bring these two 
groups together in the context of research-
practice partnerships.

Third, NNERPP aims to facilitate and pro-
duce comparative research. Although context-
specific research is of great interest to local 
policymakers, the utility of this research can-
not fully realized until the most promising pol-
icies and practices are tested in multiple loca-
tions in order to establish external validity and 
understand the conditions under which the 
findings apply. Simply determining whether or 
not something works is insufficient; it is nec-
essary to understand why it works, and it is 
impossible to do so without testing it in dif
ferent settings. Multisite comparative research 
is a powerful tool for identifying the range of 
contexts in which promising policies and prac-
tices are effective, for understanding the mech-
anisms by which they work, and for replicating 
findings.

Finally, NNERPP aims to advance broader 
policies and system reforms. Research produced 
in direct partnership between research institu-
tions and school districts should be used to 
inform national policies as well as system re-
forms. Information obtained from RPPs is 
uniquely equipped to inform national agencies 
and interest groups, especially if it has been 
vetted through carefully coordinated compara-
tive research and examined extensively by 
school district leaders who have actually im-
plemented the programs of interest; these con-
ditions can generate a higher level of buy-in 
and political will. Moreover, because this type 
of information has the greatest potential to im-
prove educational equality, it should be shared 
directly with regional and national policymak-
ers, including the U.S. Department of Educa-
tion, the Council of the Great City Schools, the 
National Public Education Support Fund, the 
U.S. Department of Health and Human Ser-
vices, the Forum for Youth Investment, state 
departments of education, and the Council of 
Chief State School Officers. A national network 
of RPPs could be an extremely effective vehicle 
for ensuring that research and policy are con-
nected in a manner that reduces educational 
inequality.

Conclusion
I began by asking why the Coleman Report and 
the decades of education research that it influ-
enced have not resulted in greater reductions 
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in educational inequities. Especially in recent 
decades, educational inequities have not been 
reduced sufficiently and progress has stalled 
or even regressed by some measures. I attri-
bute this failure in part to a significant discon-
nect between education research and policy. 
In this paper, I have described the conditions 
that produced this disconnect, as well as the 
political context that has impeded an effective 
connection between researchers and policy-
makers.

Despite these obstacles, I am optimistic 
about the next fifty years of education research. 
Several important changes since the release of 
the Coleman Report have created a more prom-
ising context for effectively connecting re-
search and policy: (1) more emphasis on local 
decision-making, coupled with a nationwide 
movement among researchers, policymakers, 
and funders to create more meaningful and ef-
fective place-based partnerships; (2) changing 
institutional incentives for both academic re-
searchers and leaders at state and local educa-
tion agencies; and (3) technological advances 
in data science. In light of these recent changes, 
I have proposed three approaches to reducing 
educational inequality by focusing on efforts 
to connect research and policy at the local, re-
gional, and national levels. Local research-
practice partnerships can help schools with 
high concentrations of disadvantaged students 
improve educational outcomes, regional ef-
forts can improve racial-ethnic and economic 
integration, and national measures can create 
an infrastructure that develops and facilitates 
work across partnerships and advances broader 
policies and system reforms.

The current political context is quite differ-
ent from that of fifty years ago. Many obstacles 
to achieving educational equality remain, but 
today’s context is much better suited for deeper 
and more effective collaboration between re-
searchers and decision-makers. We must seize 
this moment and make every effort to connect 
research and policy at the local, regional, and 
national levels, for this is how we can ensure 
that the next fifty years of education research 
will have a greater impact than has been the 
case in the last fifty years and that it will play 
a more significant role in reducing educational 
inequities.
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